Mridul Kumar Agarwal {TH.%. J3@aTa)]

%

From: Manoj Kant Sahay [TH.& OFmE)

Sent: Monday, May 04, 2020 11:51

To: Mridul Kumar Agarwal {TH %, 3@aTa); Surendra Kumar Majhi (Ti & #msi; Chhaya
Cingh }

Co Asit Kumar Maiti {#THE %51 390, Bipul Kumar fage FHIT)

Subject: RE: RTI Online status alert - FAA

Reply: As intimated by Finance department, his PF amount of Rs. 160287/~ has been settled and paid on 30.03.2020

From: Mridul Kumar Agarwal {mu ¥, s}

Sent: Thursday, April 30, 2020 14:28

To: Manoj Kant Sahay {77, 7r7}; Surendra Kumar Majhi {1 %, s7sf): Ch haya Singh {}
Ce: Asit Kumar Maiti {=7r ame #+1}; Bipul Kumar {Fro= 917}

Subject: Fwd: RTI Online status alert - FAA

Pl find attached herewith the the RTI APPEAL received from Sri Vivek kumar as we have not replied his RTI.
Pl send the reply against his RTI so that the RT1 and the Appeal can be closed at the earliest.

Regards

M K Agarwal CPIO ER1
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